ITEM#: __ 23
DATE: 04-23-19

COUNCIL ACTION FORM

SUBJECT: POWER PLANT UNIT 7 TURBINE GENERATOR OVERHAUL

BACKGROUND:

The Unit 7 Turbine Generator is scheduled to be disassembled, inspected, and repaired
at the same time as the Unit 7 Boiler Repair Project. This work is required to replace
worn parts and inspect the turbine and generator for repairs that may be needed to
prevent unplanned turbine/generator outages, prevent costly turbine/generator damage,
and increase turbine/generator reliability.

Repairs and replacement of worn parts will be completed as the inspection progresses.
Experience has shown that certain parts require replacement every major overhaul and
some parts become unusable during the disassembly process. This overhaul and parts
replacement is required and recommended by boiler and machinery insurance carriers
and follows accepted industry standards. This bid is for labor and materials for the
inspection and repairs Unit 7 Turbine Generator. There is a separate bid for spare
parts that are made available to the contractor for this repair.

The Engineer’s estimate for the cost of the total project is $2,440,000.

The approved FY 2018/19 Capital Improvements Plan includes the following funding for
the Unit 7 Turbine Generator Overhaul.

2017/18 Engineering/Parts $750,000
2018/19 Labor $1,500,000
2018/19 GE Tech Support $300,000
TOTAL $2,550,000
ALTERNATIVES:
1. Approve the preliminary plans and specifications for the Unit 7 Turbine Generator

Overhaul labor and set May 22, 2019, as the bid due date and May 28, 2019, as
the date of hearing and award of contract.

2. Do not approve which would delay this critical repair.

MANAGER'S RECOMMENDED ACTION:

The Unit 7 Turbine-Generator is scheduled for a major overhaul during the outage for
the Unit 7 Boiler Tube Repair Project, tentatively scheduled for summer of 2019.



Turbine-generator overhauls are typically performed in the industry about every five
years to restore unit efficiency and to maintain good unit life and reliability. Without this
overhaul, the Power Plant’s performance would degrade considerably over time.

Therefore, it is the recommendation of the City Manager that the City Council adopt
Alternative No. 1 as stated above.



CITY OF AMES, IOWA
INVITATION TO BID NO. 2019-095
UNIT 7 STEAM TURBINE PARTS

ARGO TURBOSERVE CORP MECHANICAL DYNAMICS & ANALYSIS (MD & A) LLC
10/ o EXTENDED - EXTENDED | Items no bid
|LT|2||5| DESCRIPTION  |oty| unitprice | sus-ToTaL e Unit Price SUB-TOTAL e M
1 |H.P. LINING 1 | $ 1745600 S 1745600 S 1745600 S  12,900.00 S  12,900.00 S _ 12,900.00
2 |L.P.LINING 1 |$ 23030.00 $ 2303000 S 23,030.00 S 18,000.00 S 18,000.00 S 18,000.00
3 /TAEFTQ:\J/?ETmm 11$ 91500 ¢ 915000 $ 9,150.00 S 8,600.00 $ 8,600.00 $ 8,600.00
4 |TNHAF§:UT?\IERING 1 1% 664000 ¢ 664000 $ 664000 S 5,685.00 $ 5,685.00 $ 5,685.00
5 [SHIM $ 234000 $  2,34000 $  2,34000  no bid $ - § 2,340.00
6 [SHIM $ 104800 $  1,94800 $  1,94800 S 1,250.00 $ 1,250.00 $ 1,250.00
! gizF)#L()EI(L:TOR 11$ 508200 ¢ 50300 $ 503200 S 6,795.00 S 6,795.00 $ 6,795.00
8 'II_'EP OILPEFLECTORL 1 |'s  s61400 $ 561400 $ 561400 S 5,800.00  $ 5,800.00 $ 5,800.00
9 cL;E OILDEFLECTORI 1 s 502100 $ 592100 $ 5921.00 S 8,900.00 $ 8,900.00 $ 8,900.00
10 |HOLDING SCREW | 8 | s 5200 $ 416.00 $ 41600  $ 3500 $ 280.00 $ 280.00
11 |PACKING RING Tls 202200 $ 202200 $ 20200 $ 1,950.00 $ 1,950.00 $ 1,950.00
12 |SPRING 6 |s 18.00 $ 108.00 $ 108.00 S 10.00 $ 60.00 $ 60.00
13 |PACKING RING 1ls 327900 $ 327900 $ 3,279.00 $ 2,300.00 $ 2,300.00 $ 2,300.00
14 |SPRING 6 |s 18.00 $ 108.00 $ 108.00 S 10.00 $ 60.00 $ 60.00
15 |PACKING RING 2 |s 327900 ¢ 655800 $ 655800 S 2,300.00 $ 4,600.00 $ 4,600.00
16 |SPRING 2 |s 18.00 $ 216.00 $ 21600 S 10.00 $ 120.00 $ 120.00
17 |PACKING RING 2 |$ 404400 $ 808800 $ 808800 S 2,750.00 $ 5,500.00 $ 5,500.00
18 |SPRING 2 |s 18.00 $ 216.00 $ 21600 S 10.00 $ 120.00 $ 120.00
19 |PACKING RING 1ls 327900 $ 327900 $ 3,279.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 3,000.00
20 |SPRING 6 |s 18.00 $ 108.00 $ 108.00 S 10.00 $ 60.00 $ 60.00
21 |PACKING RING 2 |s 255000 $ 510000 $ 510000 S 3,000.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 6,000.00
22 | SPRING 2 |s 18.00 $ 216.00 $ 21600 S 10.00 $ 120.00 $ 120.00
23 |PACKING RING 2 |s 255000 $ 510000 $ 510000 S 3,000.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 6,000.00




CITY OF AMES, IOWA
INVITATION TO BID NO. 2019-095
UNIT 7 STEAM TURBINE PARTS

ARGO TURBOSERVE CORP MECHANICAL DYNAMICS & ANALYSIS (MD & A) LLC
10/ o EXTENDED L EXTENDED Items no bid
|LTlg|5| DESCRIPTION QTY Unit Price SUB-TOTAL e Unit Price SUB-TOTAL meE by MD & A
24 |SPRING 12193 18.00| $ 216.00 | $ 216.00 S 10.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 120.00
25 |PACKING RING 113 2,550.00| $ 2,550.00 | S 2,550.00 S 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | S 3,000.00
26 |SPRING 6 |3$ 18.00| $ 108.00 | $ 108.00 S 10.00 | $ 60.00 | S 60.00
27 |PACKING RING 213 2,550.00 | $ 5,100.00 | $ 5,100.00 S 3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | S 6,000.00
28 |sSPRING 12193 18.00| $ 216.00 | § 216.00 S 10.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 120.00
29 |PACKING RING 4 |3 3,077.00| $ 12,308.00 | $ 12,308.00 S 3,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | S 12,000.00
30 |SPRING 24 1% 18.00| $ 432.00 | S 432.00 S 10.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 240.00
31 |PACKING RING 2 |3 3,077.00| $ 6,154.00 | S 6,154.00 S 3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | S 6,000.00
32 |SPRING 121% 18.00| $ 216.00 | $§ 216.00 S 10.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 120.00
33 |PACKING RING 113 4,205.00| $ 4,205.00 | S 4,205.00 S 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | S 3,000.00
34 |SPRING 6193 18.00| S 108.00 | S 108.00 S 10.00 | $ 60.00 | S 60.00
35 |PACKING RING 113 4,205.00| $ 4,205.00 | S 4,205.00 S 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | S 3,000.00
36 |SPRING 6 |$ 18.00| $ 108.00 | $ 108.00 S 10.00 | $ 60.00 | S 60.00
37 |PACKING RING 113 4,205.00| $ 4,205.00 | S 4,205.00 S 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | S 3,000.00
38 |SPRING 6 |$ 18.00| $ 108.00 | $ 108.00 S 10.00 | $ 60.00 | S 60.00
39 |PACKING LOCK 113 201.00| $ 201.00 | $§ 201.00 S 60.00 | $ 60.00 | S 60.00
40 JPACKING LOCK 8 |$ 181.00| $ 1,448.00 | $ 1,448.00 S 60.00 | $ 480.00 | S 480.00
41 |VALVE SEAT 1|l$ 7,280.00|S$ 7,280.00 | S 7,280.00 S 9,250.00 | S 9,250.00 | $ 9,250.00
42 |GASKET 213 41.00| S 82.00 | $ 82.00 S 30.00 | $ 60.00 | S 60.00
43 |BUSHING 113 2,574.00| $ 2,574.00 | $ 2,574.00 S 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00 | S 2,200.00
44 |STEM 113 4,063.00| $ 4,063.00 | S 4,063.00 S 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | S 3,200.00
45 |BUSHING 113 1,625.00| $ 1,625.00 | S 1,625.00 S 1,395.00 | $ 1,395.00 | $ 1,395.00
46 |PIN 113 52.00| $ 52.00 | S 52.00 S 60.00 | $ 60.00 | S 60.00
47 |BUSHING 113 738.00| $ 738.00 | $§ 738.00 S 325.00 | $ 325.00 | $ 325.00
48 |BYPASS VALVE 113 3,075.00| $ 3,075.00 | $ 3,075.00 S 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00
49 |JCAP SCREW 6 |$ 47.00| S 282.00 | $§ 282.00 S 45.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 270.00
50 |PIN 113 67.00| S 67.00 | S 67.00 S 55.00 | S 55.00 | S 55.00




CITY OF AMES, IOWA

INVITATION TO BID NO. 2019-095
UNIT 7 STEAM TURBINE PARTS

ARGO TURBOSERVE CORP MECHANICAL DYNAMICS & ANALYSIS (MD & A) LLC
10/ . EXTENDED . EXTENDED | Items no bid
|LT|2||5| DESCRIPTION  |oty|  unitprice | sus-ToTAL oRICE Unit Price SUB-TOTAL v S
51 [PIN 113 2.00| S 2.00 | S 2.00 S 5.00 | S 5.00 | S 5.00
52 |GASKET 2 |s 180.00| $ 360.00 | $ 360.00 S 140.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 280.00
53 |HEIM JOINT 1|s 32.00| $ 32.00 | $ 3200 $ 30.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 30.00
54 |PACKING 1|s 278.00| $ 278.00 | $ 27800  $ 245.00 | $ 245.00 | $ 245.00
55 |GASKET 1 |s 83.00| $ 83.00 | $ 83.00 S 45.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 45.00
56 |GASKET 1 |s 20.00| $ 20.00 | $ 2000 $ 69.00 | $ 69.00 | $ 69.00
57 |PISTON RING 2 | s 453.00| $ 906.00 | $ 906.00 S 1.00 | $ 200 $ 2.00
58 |GASKET 1|s 50.00| $ 50.00 | $ 5000  $ 40.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 40.00
59 |GASKET 1|s 21.00| $ 21.00 | $ 2100 $ 30.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 30.00
60 |PISTON RING 2 | s 223.00| $ 446.00 | $ 446.00 S 125.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
61 |GASKET 1 |s 83.00| $ 83.00 | $ 83.00 S 85.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 85.00
FINE / COURSE
62 |screen kiT 2 |$ 288000 |¢ 576000|$ 576000  nobid $  5,760.00
63 |SPILL STRIP 16| s 14500 $  2,32000|$ 232000 S 80.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 1,280.00
64 |SPRING 15| s 17.00| $ 255.00 | $ 25500  $ 15.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00
65 |SPRING 1 |s 17.00| $ 17.00 | $ 17.00 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
66 |SPILL STRIP 16| s 14500 $  2,32000|$ 232000 S 80.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 1,280.00
67 |SPRING 15| s 17.00| $ 255.00 | $ 25500  $ 15.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00
68 |SPRING 1 |s 17.00| $ 17.00 | $ 17.00 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
69 |SPILL STRIP 16| s 14500 $  2,32000|$ 232000 S 80.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 1,280.00
70 |SPRING 15| s 17.00| $ 255.00 | $ 25500  $ 15.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00
71 |SPRING 1 |s 17.00| $ 17.00 | $ 17.00 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
72 |SPILL STRIP 16| s 14500 $  2,32000|$ 232000 S 80.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 1,280.00
73 |SPRING 15| s 17.00| $ 255.00 | $ 25500  $ 15.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00
74 |SPRING 1 |s 17.00| $ 17.00 | $ 17.00 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
75 |SPILL STRIP 16| s 14500 $  2,32000|$ 232000 S 80.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 1,280.00
76 |SPRING 15| s 17.00| $ 255.00 | $ 25500  $ 15.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00




CITY OF AMES, IOWA

INVITATION TO BID NO. 2019-095
UNIT 7 STEAM TURBINE PARTS

ARGO TURBOSERVE CORP MECHANICAL DYNAMICS & ANALYSIS (MD & A) LLC
10/ o EXTENDED L EXTENDED Items no bid
|LTlg|5| DESCRIPTION QTY Unit Price SUB-TOTAL e Unit Price SUB-TOTAL meE by MD & A
77 |SPRING 113 17.00| S 17.00 | $ 17.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
78 |SPILL STRIP 16 1% 145.00 | $ 2,320.00 | S 2,320.00 S 80.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 1,280.00
79 |SPRING 151 % 17.00| $ 255.00 | $§ 255.00 S 15.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00
80 |SPRING 113 17.00| S 17.00 | S 17.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 | S 15.00
81 |SPILL STRIP 181$%$ 145.00| $ 2,610.00 | S 2,610.00 S 80.00 | $ 1,440.00 | $ 1,440.00
82 |SPRING 171% 17.00| $ 289.00 | $§ 289.00 S 15.00 | $ 255.00 | $ 255.00
83 |SPRING 113 17.00| S 17.00 | S 17.00 S 1.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1.00
84 |SPILL STRIP 181$%$ 145.00| $ 2,610.00 | S 2,610.00 S 80.00 | $ 1,440.00 | $ 1,440.00
85 |SPRING 171% 17.00| $ 289.00 | $§ 289.00 S 15.00 | $ 255.00 | $ 255.00
86 |SPRING 113 17.00| S 17.00 | S 17.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 | S 15.00
87 |SPILL STRIP 24 1% 145.00 | $ 3,480.00 | S 3,480.00 S 80.00 | $ 1,920.00 | $ 1,920.00
88 |SPRING 2313 17.00| $ 391.00 | $§ 391.00 S 15.00 | $ 345.00 | $ 345.00
89 |SPRING 113 17.00| S 17.00 | S 17.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 | S 15.00
90 |SPILL STRIP 24 1% 145.00| $ 3,480.00 | S 3,480.00 S 80.00 | $ 1,920.00 | $ 1,920.00
91 |SPRING 2313 17.00| $ 391.00 | $ 391.00 S 15.00 | $ 345.00 | $ 345.00
92 |SPRING 113 17.00| $ 17.00 | S 17.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 | S 15.00
93 |SPILL STRIP 24 1% 145.00| $ 3,480.00 | S 3,480.00 S 80.00 | $ 1,920.00 | $ 1,920.00
94 |SPRING 2313 17.00| $ 391.00 | $§ 391.00 S 15.00 | $ 345.00 | $ 345.00
95 |SPRING 113 17.00| S 17.00 | S 17.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 | S 15.00
96 |SPILL STRIP 26| $ 145.00| $ 3,770.00 | S 3,770.00 S 80.00 | $ 2,080.00 | S 2,080.00
97 |SPRING 251$ 17.00| $ 425.00 | S 425.00 S 15.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 375.00
98 |SPRING 113 17.00| S 17.00 | S 17.00 S 15.00 | $ 15.00 | S 15.00
99 |BOLT 131% 103.00| $ 1,339.00 | $ 1,339.00 S 98.00 | $ 1,274.00 | $ 1,274.00
100 JCAULKING STRIPS | 24| % 70.00| $ 1,680.00 | S 1,680.00 S 50.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
101 IBOLTS 713 159.00| $ 1,113.00 | $ 1,113.00 S 175.00 | $ 1,225.00 | $ 1,225.00
102 |BUSHING 413 737.00| S 2,948.00 | S 2,948.00 S 175.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 700.00
103 |BUSHING UPPER 213 1,009.00| $ 2,018.00 | S 2,018.00 S 975.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 1,950.00




CITY OF AMES, IOWA
INVITATION TO BID NO. 2019-095
UNIT 7 STEAM TURBINE PARTS

ARGO TURBOSERVE CORP MECHANICAL DYNAMICS & ANALYSIS (MD & A) LLC
10/ .y EXTENDED . EXTENDED | Items no bid
|LT|||;||5| DESCRIPTION |oTy|  unit Price SUB-TOTAL PRICE Unit Price SUB-TOTAL bRICE 0 B
104 |BUSHING LOWER 2 |$ 146800]$ 2936.00|$ 293600 @ $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,800.00
2
105 |BUSHING sonst $ 989.00| ¢ 197800 |$ 1,97800 S 225.00 | 4each=%900 | 900.00
106 |BUSHING 2 |$ 102800/ $ 2,05600|$ 205600 @ $ 295.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 590.00
107 |CLEVIS PIN 1]s 591.00| $ 591.00 | $ 591.00 $ 325.00 | $ 325.00 | $ 325.00
108 |BEARING 1]s 544.00| $ 544.00 | $ 544.00 @ $ 495.00 | $ 495.00 | $ 495.00
109 |RELIEF DIAPHRAGM | 1 | $ 979.00 ¢ 979.00 | $ 979.00 ¢ 1,450.00 | $ 1,450.00 | $ 1,450.00
110 |VALVE 1|$ 506900/$ 5069.00[$ 506900 S 2,350.00 | $ 2,350.00 | $ 2,350.00
111 |VALVE SEAT 1|$ 296700|$ 2967.00$ 2,967.00 S 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00
112 |VALVE SEAT 1193 1,233.00| $ 1,233.00 | $ 1,233.00 S 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00
113 |VALVE 1 |$ 194800|$ 1,948.00|$ 194800 @ $ 3,450.00 | $ 3,450.00 | $ 3,450.00
114 |GASKET 1]s 14.00| $ 14.00 | $ 1400  $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
115 |PIVOT ROD 1]s 611.00| $ 611.00 | $ 611.00 $ 485.00 | $ 485.00 | $ 485.00
116 |NUT 2 |3 2.00| $ 4.00 | $ 400 S 5.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00
117 |PIvOT ROD 1]s 603.00| $ 603.00 | $ 603.00 $ 475.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 475.00
118 |PIvOT BLOCK 1]s 567.00| $ 567.00 | $ 567.00 $ 375.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 375.00
119 |BEARING 2 |3 26.00| $ 52.00 | $ 5200 $ 18.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 36.00
120 |SHAFT 1]s 201.00| $ 291.00 | $ 291.00 S 795.00 | $ 795.00 | $ 795.00
121 |SPRING 1]s 685.00| $ 685.00 | $ 685.00 $ 625.00 | $ 625.00 | $ 625.00
122 |SPRING 1]s 495.00| $ 495.00 | $ 495.00  $ 450.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 450.00
123 |BEARING 1 |s 159.00| $ 159.00 | $ 159.00 S 110.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 110.00
124 |BUSHING 213 665.00| $ 1,330.00 | $ 1,330.00 S 600.00 | S 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
125 |PISTON RING 113 180.00| $ 180.00 | S 180.00 S 80.00 | S 80.00 | $ 80.00
126 |PILOT VALVE 1 |$ 144700 1,447.00|$ 1,447.00 S 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00
127 |BELLOWS ASSY 1 |$ 3131.00/$ 3,131.00|$ 3,131.00 S 3,400.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 3,400.00
128 |SPRING 1]s 735.00| $ 735.00 | $ 735.00 $ 575.00 | $ 575.00 | $ 575.00
129 |SPRING 1]s 579.00| $ 579.00 | $ 579.00 $ 585.00 | $ 585.00 | $ 585.00




CITY OF AMES, IOWA

INVITATION TO BID NO. 2019-095
UNIT 7 STEAM TURBINE PARTS

ARGO TURBOSERVE CORP MECHANICAL DYNAMICS & ANALYSIS (MD & A) LLC
10/ o EXTENDED L EXTENDED Items no bid
|LT||';||5| DESCRIPTION QTY Unit Price SUB-TOTAL e Unit Price SUB-TOTAL meE by MD & A
130 |BUSHING 2 |3 206.00| $ 412.00 | S 412.00 S 145.00 | $ 290.00 | $ 290.00
131 |JOIL SEAL 113 17.00| $ 17.00 | $ 17.00 S 20.00 | $ 20.00 | S 20.00
132 |BUSHING 2 |3 252.00| $ 504.00 | $ 504.00 S 275.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00
133 |BUSHING 2 |3 187.00| $ 374.00 | $§ 374.00 S 135.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 270.00
134 |KEY 113 206.00| $ 206.00 | $ 206.00 no bid S 206.00
135 |BUSHING 2 |3 623.00| $ 1,246.00 | $ 1,246.00 S 200.00 | $ 400.00 | S 400.00
136 |O-RING 113 4.00| S 4.00 | S 4.00 S 5.00 | $ 5.00 | S 5.00
137 |GASKET 113 18.00| $ 18.00 | S 18.00 S 30.00 | $ 30.00 | S 30.00
138 |ROD END 213 18.00| $ 36.00 | S 36.00 S 20.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 40.00
139 |SWITCH 113 2,079.00| $ 2,079.00 | S 2,079.00 no bid S 2,079.00
140 |GASKET 213 74.00| S 148.00 | S 148.00 S 52.00 | $ 104.00 | $ 104.00
141 |GASKET 113 28.00| $ 28.00 | S 28.00 S 50.00 | S 50.00 | S 50.00
142 JGASKET 213 202.00| $ 404.00 | S 404.00 no bid S 404.00
143 |GASKET 11]s 6.00| S 6.00 | $ 6.00 S 25.00 | $ 25.00 | S 25.00
144 |OIL SEAL 113 24.00| S 24.00 | S 24.00 S 32.00 | $ 32.00 | S 32.00
145 JGASKET 213 17.00| $ 34.00 | S 34.00 S 15.00 | $ 30.00 | S 30.00
146 |OIL SEAL 113 18.00| S 18.00 | $ 18.00 S 18.00 | $§ 18.00 | $ 18.00
147 |GASKET 113 59.00| $ 59.00 | S 59.00 S 72.00 | $ 72.00 | S 72.00
148 |GASKET 213 21.00| S 42,00 | $ 42.00 no bid S 42.00
149 |GASKET 113 29.00| $ 29.00 | S 29.00 no bid S 29.00
150 |GASKET 11]s 8.00| S 8.00 | S 8.00 S 65.00 | $ 65.00 | S 65.00
151 |BEARING 213 1,233.00| $ 2,466.00 | S 2,466.00 S 1,350.00 | $ 2,700.00 | S 2,700.00
152 |SHAFT 113 8,935.00 | $ 8,935.00 | $ 8,935.00 S 7,250.00 | $ 7,250.00 | S 7,250.00
153 JQUILL 113 6,700.00 | $ 6,700.00 | S 6,700.00 S 5,900.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $ 5,900.00
154 |THRUST PLATE 113 6,505.00 | $ 6,505.00 | $ 6,505.00 S 3,650.00 | $ 3,650.00 | S 3,650.00
155 |SEAL RING 2 |3 735.00| $ 1,470.00 | S 1,470.00 S 975.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 1,950.00
156 |KEY 113 175.00| $ 175.00 | S 175.00 S 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00




CITY OF AMES, IOWA
INVITATION TO BID NO. 2019-095
UNIT 7 STEAM TURBINE PARTS

ARGO TURBOSERVE CORP MECHANICAL DYNAMICS & ANALYSIS (MD & A) LLC
10/ o EXTENDED o EXTENDED | Items no bid
|LT|||;||5| DESCRIPTION  |QTY|  unit Price SUB-TOTAL iteched Unit Price SUB-TOTAL itehend by MD & A
157 |IMPELLER 1 ]|$ 23087005 23,087.00|S 23,087.00 no bid $ 23,087.00
158 |PILOT VALVE 1|ls 313100/$ 3,131.00|$  3,131.00 S 3,150.00 | $ 3,150.00 | $ 3,150.00
159 |SEAL 113 19.00| $ 19.00 | $ 19.00 S 18.00 | 18.00 | $ 18.00
160 |SPRING 1]s 579.00| $ 579.00 | $ 579.00 S 550.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 550.00
161 |SPRING 1]s 685.00 | S 685.00 | $ 685.00 no bid S 685.00
162 |SEAL 113 28.00| $ 28.00 | S 28.00 S 20.00 | S 20.00 | S 20.00
163 |GASKET 1]s 10.00| $ 10.00 | $ 10.00 S 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00
164 EEQRING HNNGTEL 1 s 2120000 $ 2129000 |$ 2129000 ¢ 1889500 |$ 1889500 |$  18,895.00
165 gEEﬁIR'NG HNINGCE 1 s 2173500 $ 21,73500 | ¢ 21,735.00 $  18,995.00 | $  18,995.00 | $  18,995.00
166 |H2 SEAL RING TE 1|ls 551000/$ 551000|$  5,510.00 S 4,400.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 4,400.00
167 |SPRING 213 306.00| $ 612.00 | $ 612.00 S 345.00 | $ 690.00 | $ 690.00
168 |OIL DEFLECTOR 1|$ 255500/$ 2555.00|$  2,555.00 S 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00
169 |H2 SEAL RING CE 1|ls 551000/$ 551000|$  5,510.00 S 4,400.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 4,400.00
170 |SPRING 2 1% 306.00| $ 612.00 | $ 612.00 S 345.00 | $ 690.00 | $ 690.00
171 |OIL DEFLECTOR 1|ls 255500/$ 255500|$  2,555.00 S 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00
172 |OIL FELECTOR 2 1% 7.430.00( $ 14,860.00 | $ 14,860.00 S 7,450.00 | $ 14,900.00 | $ 14,900.00
173 |OIL FELECTOR 2 1% 7,545.00( $ 15,090.00 | $ 15,090.00 S 7,200.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 14,400.00
lot transportation 1 $ 18,690.00| S 18,690.00 | S 18,690.00 freight not included
TOTAL $ 427,759.00 | $ 427,759.00 $ 318,681.00 | $ 318,681.00 | $ 34,632.00
total w/out freight S 409,069.00
total w/out freight or items no bid by MD & A S 374,437.00

NON-RESPONSIVE
BIDDERS:

Steam Turbine Alternativev Resources (STAR)

The Progress Group

no bid bond
no bid bond
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	ITEM #: __ 23__
	2017/18 Engineering/Parts                $750,000
	2018/19 Labor                                $1,500,000
	2018/19 GE Tech Support                $300,000
	TOTAL                             $2,550,000
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